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Alerts

1 event
27 results matching for 'Innovation Patents Sealed' during September 2012.

Number Title Date
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2012100819 Shower Base 13 Sep 2012

2012100843 Glazing Frame Sound Attenuator 13 Sep 2012

2012100913 Twin tub cleaning bucket 13 Sep 2012

2012101108 90-degree electrical distribution boards 13 Sep 2012

2012101117 Infrared Thermography and Measurement of Emotion 13 Sep 2012

2012101184 Seal ring and joint 13 Sep 2012

2012101187 Filter assembly 13 Sep 2012

2012101215 System and method for crowd-funded selection and reward contest 13 Sep 2012

2012101220 Solar panel safety isolater 13 Sep 2012

2012101222 Radio Frequency Identification (RFID) beacon including controllable signal direction and
range

13 Sep 2012

2012101225 Syringe safety device and method of syringe disposal 13 Sep 2012

2012101230 Self-massage back cushion 13 Sep 2012

2012101231 Classified shopping bag 13 Sep 2012

2012101233 Panel mount 13 Sep 2012

2012101234 Bag making and packaging machine 13 Sep 2012

2012101235 Rapid load capacity test 13 Sep 2012

2012101242 A machine for dispensing a food product 13 Sep 2012

2012101244 Piece of cake cake finder 13 Sep 2012

2012101250 Improved faucet with floating seal member 13 Sep 2012

2012101251 Ankle Measure for Endurance and Strength (AMES) 13 Sep 2012

2012101253 Epicyclical Drive Sound Attenuation on Off-Highway Dump Truck 13 Sep 2012

2012101254 A Surgical Sponge 13 Sep 2012

2012101258 Filter used for filtering molten metal and preparation method thereof 13 Sep 2012

2012101259 A water heater 13 Sep 2012

2012101261 Tungsten carbide spade bit 13 Sep 2012

2012101268 A Type of Plant Pot with Wood Clamp 13 Sep 2012

2011100773 A method and system to edit textual information on a mobile device in creating a message
for transmission as a multimedia message within a cellular network

13 Sep 2012
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Terms and Conditions
General

The information provided in this report is not in the nature of legal or other professional advice.

The information provided in this report is derived from third parties and may contain errors. You must
make your own enquiries and seek independent advice from the relevant industry professionals
regarding any information in this report.

Patents, patent applications, trademarks and trademark applications shown as lapsed or ceased may be
restored at a later date.

Disclaimer of warranty and limitation of liability

Neither IPMonitor, its affiliates nor any of their respective employees, agents, third party content
providers or licensors warrant that the information contained in this report is error free; nor do they
make any warranty as to the accuracy, reliability or content of any information in this report.

This report is provided on an "as is" basis; to the maximum extent permitted by law, IPMonitor
disclaims all representations and warranties, express or implied, with respect to any information
conatined in this report. In addition, IPMonitor does not represent or warrant that the information
contained in this report is accurate, complete or current.

This disclaimer of liability applies to any damages or injury caused by any failure of performance,
error, omission, interruption, deletion, defect, delay in operation or transmission, computer virus,
communication line failure, theft or destruction or unauthorized access to, alteration of, or use of
record, whether for breach of contract, tortious behavior, negligence, or under any other cause of
action.

Copyright

The content of this report may be protected by copyright laws and treaties around the world and all
rights relating to the same are reserved. Any paper or digital copies of this report are not to be
modified or any illustrations or any graphics used separately from any accompanying text.

Arbitration

Any dispute or difference whatsoever arising out of or in connection with this report shall be
submitted to arbitration in accordance with, and subject to, The Institute of Arbitrators & Mediators
Australia Rules for the Conduct of Commercial Arbitrations.

IPMonitor reserves the right to update the Terms and Conditions at any time without notice. Please
see the full Terms and Conditions at www.IPMonitor.com.au/trademarks/info/terms
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